
BRIDAL 2020 COLLECTION



For 2020, the Jimmy Choo Bridal Collection offers 
a wardrobe of beautiful styles underpinned by 
timeless and classic elegance, from ivory satin 
courts to the Hollywood glamour of Swarovski 
crystal embellished pumps, strappy single-soled 
sandals to more fashion-forward seasonal designs.  
Realised in a delicate colour scheme of ivory and 
champagne glitter, with an exquisite array of details 
including; ethereal feathers, Swarovski crystals, lace, 
beading and glitter finishes.
 
For brides that dare to stand out classic silhouettes 
are given a playful touch.  The stunning SACORA , a 
vintage inspired sandal with a delicate ankle strap 
offered in nude suede with hotfix crystals decorated 
with a hand crafted crystal sphere, or delicate ivory 
lace decorated with a pearl that adorns the elegant 
V-cut peep toe.
 
Those seeking something more dramatic can find 
unexpected twists on classic designs such as the 
AMBRE slingback in ivory satin which features a 
flamboyant spray of ethereal feathers and finished 
with a trim of sparkling crystals that wrap gracefully 
around the foot. 
 
The Bridal Collection is available at Jimmy Choo 
stores worldwide and online at JIMMYCHOO.COM

Bridal 2020

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/bridal-boutique/
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/sacora-85/ivory-floral-lace-sandals-with-pearl-detail-SACORA85FXW000698.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/ambre-100/ivory-satin-slingback-heels-with-ostrich-feather-and-crystal-trim-AMBRE100IOF000784.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/home


AMBRE  100
Satin with Ostrich Feathers and Crystals – Ivory, Crystal

CALLIE
Ostrich Feathers – LatteCallie / Ambre

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/ambre-100/ivory-satin-slingback-heels-with-ostrich-feather-and-crystal-trim-AMBRE100IOF000784.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/ambre-100/ivory-satin-slingback-heels-with-ostrich-feather-and-crystal-trim-AMBRE100IOF000784.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/handbags/callie/latte-leather-clutch-bag-with-ostrich-feather--CALLIEOHF080258.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/handbags/callie/latte-leather-clutch-bag-with-ostrich-feather--CALLIEOHF080258.html


LoveLOVE  85
Coarse Glitter Fabric – White

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/love-85/white-glitter-fabric-pumps-LOVE85CGF080009.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/love-85/white-glitter-fabric-pumps-LOVE85CGF080009.html


Lavish LAVISH  100
Satin with Glitter Tulle – Ivory, White and Silver

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/lavish-100/ivory-satin-pumps-with-white-glitter-tulle-overlay-LAVISH100ZXC0C8065.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/lavish-100/ivory-satin-pumps-with-white-glitter-tulle-overlay-LAVISH100ZXC0C8065.html


LOVE  85
Fine Glitter Fabric with Glitter Tulle – Ivory, Silver Love

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/love-85/metallic-silver-glitter-fabric-pumps-with-ivory-tulle-overlay-LOVE85TFG0C3537.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/love-85/metallic-silver-glitter-fabric-pumps-with-ivory-tulle-overlay-LOVE85TFG0C3537.html


ELLIPSE
Satin with Mini Flower Paillette Embroidery – Ivory

ROMY  85
Satin with Mini Flower Paillette Embroidery – IvoryRomy / Ellipse

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/handbags/ellipse/latte-suede-clutch-bag-with-with-flower-sequin-embroidery-ELLIPSEPDR080258.html


Love LOVE  100
Mismatch Crystal Necklace on Satin – Ivory, Something Blue Mix

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/love-100/ivory-satin-pumps-with-crystal-necklace-detail-LOVE100CNZ0C8063.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/love-100/ivory-satin-pumps-with-crystal-necklace-detail-LOVE100CNZ0C8063.html


RomyROMY  100
Dusty Glitter – Platinum Ice

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/romy-100/platinum-ice-dusty-glitter-pointy-toe-pumps--ROMY100DGZAA0582.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/romy-100/platinum-ice-dusty-glitter-pointy-toe-pumps--ROMY100DGZAA0582.html


CLOUD
Crystal – Nude

SABINE  85
Crystal – Nude, CrystalSabine / Cloud

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/handbags/cloud/nude-shimmer-suede-clutch-bag-with-hotfix-and-crystal-encrusted-sphere-clasp-CLOUDHQX0C2513.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/sabine-85/nude-suede-dorsay-pumps-with-hotfix-crystals-and-sphere-detail-SABINE85PHZ0C2513.html


SacoraSACORA  85
Floral Lace with Pearl – Ivory, White

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/sacora-85/ivory-floral-lace-sandals-with-pearl-detail-SACORA85FXW000698.html
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/sacora-85/ivory-floral-lace-sandals-with-pearl-detail-SACORA85FXW000698.html


Made-to-Order

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/made-to-order-women-shoes/


LilahLILAH  120
Dusty Glitter – Platinum Ice

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/lilah-100/platinum-ice-dusty-glitter-platform-sandals-LILAH100DGZAA0582.html#q=lilah&start=1
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/women/shoes/lilah-100/platinum-ice-dusty-glitter-platform-sandals-LILAH100DGZAA0582.html#q=lilah&start=1


Falcon FALCON
Brush Off Leather with Crystal Welt – Black, Black

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/men/shoes/falcon/black-brush-off-leather-oxford-shoes-with-crystals-FALCONUAW000074.html#q=falcon&start=1
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/men/shoes/falcon/black-brush-off-leather-oxford-shoes-with-crystals-FALCONUAW000074.html#q=falcon&start=1


J I M M YC H O O.C O M

https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/home
https://www.jimmychoo.com/en/home

